
Sweet Delilah Swim Club By Jones Hope Wooten.   

Directed By Savanna Hunt August 21 - 24, 2025  

Five Southern women, whose friendships began many years ago on their college swim 
team, set aside a long weekend every August to recharge those relationships. Free from 
husbands, kids, and jobs, they meet at the same beach cottage, the “Sweet Delilah” on 
North Carolina’s Outer Banks to catch up, laugh, and meddle in each other’s lives. THE 
SWEET DELILAH SWIM CLUB focuses on four of those weekends and spans a period of 
thirty-three years.   

   

The Addams Family Book by MARSHALL BRICKMAN and RICK ELICE  
Music and Lyrics by ANDREW LIPPA.     

Directed by Kelly Finley October 23 - 26, 2025   

A comical feast that embraces the wackiness in every family, features an original story and 
it’s every father’s nightmare: Wednesday Addams, the ultimate princess of darkness, has 
grown up and fallen in love with a sweet, smart young man from a respectable family – a 
man her parents have never met. And if that wasn’t upsetting enough, Wednesday confides 
in her father and begs him not to tell her mother. Now, Gomez Addams must do something 
he’s never done before – keep a secret from his beloved wife, Morticia. Everything will 
change for the whole family on the fateful night they host a dinner for Wednesday’s 
“normal” boyfriend and his parents.  

   

It's A Wonderful Life A radio play adapted by Joe Landry     

December 18-19 2025 Plated Dinner by Chef Jamie Keating.   

This beloved American holiday classic comes to captivating life as a live 1940s radio 
broadcast. With the help of an ensemble that brings a few dozen characters to the stage, 
the story of idealistic George Bailey unfolds as he considers ending his life one fateful 
Christmas Eve.  

   

On The Verge or The Geography of Yearning By Eric Overmyer February 19 - 22, 2026 
Directed by Kim Barber Knoll  

Three Victorian lady travelers take it upon themselves to discover the mystery of things as 
they set out for Terra Incognita and discover the future.  



   

Godspell 2012 Book by John Michael Tebelak Music by Stephen Schwartz  

Directed by Jack Morman June 11-14, 2026  

A masterful retelling of the original sensation, injected with contemporary references and 
dazzling new arrangements. Prepare for the timeless tale of friendship, loyalty and love 
based on the Gospel According to St. Matthew. A small group of people help Jesus Christ 
tell different parables by using a wide variety of games, storytelling techniques and hefty 
doses of comic timing. An eclectic blend of songs, ranging in style from pop to vaudeville, is 
employed as the story of Jesus' life dances across the stage. Dissolving hauntingly into the 
Last Supper and the Crucifixion, Jesus' messages of kindness, tolerance and love come 
vibrantly to life.  

   

LTA    

Puffs! (Two Act for Young Wizards) 
by Matt Cox. Directed by Kelly Finley April 16-19, 2026  

For seven years a certain boy wizard went to a certain Wizard School and conquered evil. 
This, however, is not his story. This is the story of the Puffs... who just happened to be there 
too. A tale for anyone who has never been destined to save the world.  

 


